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“Snoopy and Gang” © 2024 Peanuts Worldwide LLC.

and photographs illuminate the story 
behind the creation of this most popular 
and influential cartoon strip. Comic strips 
by George Herriman (Krazy Kat), Milton 
Caniff (Terry and the Pirates), and Elzie C. 
Segar (Thimble Theatre Starring Popeye) 
shed light on how these prominent cartoon-
ists influenced Schulz as a young artist and 
reveal the contrast of Schulz’s drawing style 
to the elaborately illustrated cartoons popu-
lar during the early 20th century.
     “Comic strips are an art form: a means 
of expressing an idea of a great truth in an 
abbreviated space,” Schulz noted in 1985.  
He was “master of the slight incident” and 
broke new ground for newspaper cartoons 
by using innovations such as Lucy’s psychi-
atric booth, Linus’ security blanket (a term 
Schulz coined), Snoopy’s dog house, and 
Schroeder’s music. He profoundly influ-
enced several generations of cartoonists 
with his spare graphic style and subtle sense 
of humor. “With intelligence, honesty, and 
wonderfully expressive artwork, Charles 
Schulz gave the comics a unique world 
of humor, fantasy, warmth, and pain that 
completely reconfigured the comic strip 
landscape,” wrote Bill Watterson, creator of 
Calvin and Hobbes, in 1989.

     Schulz revolutionized the art of the com-
ic strip through his single-handed dedica-
tion to the art, wit, and wisdom of Peanuts. 
For 50 years he researched, wrote, designed, 
and drew each Peanuts strip that appeared 
in daily and Sunday newspapers, producing 
nearly 18,000 strips. From the comic strip’s 
humble beginnings in 1950, appearing in 
only seven newspapers, Peanuts’ popularity 
and influence grew rapidly. 
     By 2000 it was the most successful 
comic strip in newspaper history, appear-
ing in over 40 languages, in 75 countries, in 
more than 2,600 newspapers, with over 355 
million readers. The strip and its charac-
ters were also the inspiration for nearly 50 
television specials, two plays, four movies, 
a symphonic concerto, many books, and 
thousands of licensed products. Peanuts 
products became a billion-dollar worldwide 
industry, and Schulz became the highest 
paid, most widely read cartoonist in history.
     Schulz officially retired in Dec. 1999 
and always intended that the strip would 
retire with him. On Feb. 12, 2000, at age 
77, just hours before the final Peanuts strip 
appeared in Sunday newspapers, Charles 
Schulz died at his home in Santa Rosa, CA. 

The next morning, tributes ran in newspa-
pers around the world, including one from 
then-US President Bill Clinton in USA 
Today: “The hopeful and hapless Charlie 
Brown, the joyful Snoopy, the soulful Li-
nus, even the crabby Lucy, give voice, day 
after day, to what makes us human.” 
     In the Feb. 28, 2000, edition of People 
magazine, Rheta Grimsley Johnson, author 
of the 1989 biography Good Grief: The 
Story of Charles M. Schulz, observed, “He 
showed there was a market for innocence.  
People may be seduced by glitter, sopho-
moric stunts and shock radio, but deep 
down we all yearn for something simple 
and profound that will endure. He gave that 
to us.”
     The Life and Art of Charles M. Schulz is 
curated by the Charles M. Schulz Museum 
and Research Center in Santa Rosa, CA.
     Open since 2002, the Charles M. Schulz 
Museum and Research Center houses the 
largest collection of historical artifacts and 
original artwork by and about Charles M. 
Schulz in the world. The Schulz Museum 
features more than 6,000 square feet of gal-
lery space; a re-creation of Schulz’s studio 
office; outdoor gardens and exhibitions (in-
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cluding a Snoopy labyrinth and a kite-eating 
tree); a 100-seat theatre; a research library 
and archives; and an education building 
with hands-on activities and classes. For 
more information on the Charles M. Schulz 
Museum and Research Center, please visit 
(www.schulzmuseum.org).  
     Nov. 1956 marked the beginning of the 
Alamance County Arts Council. There 
is little written history about this humble 
beginning, but the local Community Coun-
cil helped to establish the art association. 
Alamance Arts is a nonprofit organization 
that is committed to shaping the cultural 
identity of Alamance County by making 
art a tangible presence in the lives of its 
residents. Alamance Arts strives to enhance 
the quality of life by engaging people in a 
diverse array of art through the delivery of 
programming and education and through 
the provision of facilities, advocacy, promo-
tion and funding. Alamance Arts is in the 
Historic Captain White House, located on S. 
Main Street in Graham, NC – just  off exit 
147. 
     For further information check our NC 
Institutional Gallery listings or visit (www.
alamancearts.org).
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